
  
 

LexisNexis Announces Partnership with Australian Business Solutions Provider, 
Eclipse 

 
Eclipse’s Data Migration Tool built into new Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 Business 

Management System 
 

LONDON, 11 October 2012 – LexisNexis® Enterprise Solutions (www.lexisnexis-es.co.uk), a leading 
provider of content and technology solutions, today announced a partnership with Eclipse Computing 
(Australia) Pty Ltd (Eclipse), a provider of intelligent business solutions to the enterprise and mid-
market. Eclipse’s Data Migration Tool (DMT) is being built into the LexisNexis business management 
system (code-named Nimbus) developed for the legal sector on the Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 
platform.  
 
Eclipses’ DMT will enable the Nimbus implementation team to easily transfer customers’ transactional 
data from their existing systems into the new Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 solution. The U.K. 
Solicitors Regulation Authority’s accounting rules require legal services providers to report end-to-end 
on all transactions undertaken by organisations for audit purposes. Accurate migration of data is 
therefore crucial to the successful implementation of the new Nimbus platform.  
 
“We selected Eclipse for the company’s advanced knowledge of the Microsoft Dynamics AX platform,” 
said Laura Whitehead, Head of Marketing, LexisNexis Enterprise Solutions. “It is important that we 
partner with organisations of the highest calibre and those that have an understanding of both our 
technology and the markets we serve.” 
 
Recently awarded the 2012 Australian Microsoft Dynamics ERP Partner of the Year and welcomed 
into the prestigious Microsoft Dynamics Inner Circle, Eclipse has a team of more than 400 people 
globally supporting 1,200 customer sites. Eclipse is committed to providing the highest level of 
customer service, development and support across Australasia and North America. 
 
Bradley Stroop, Chief Executive Officer, Eclipse, added: “Both organisations are driven by a customer 
orientated approach and commitment to continuous technological improvement. The Nimbus solution 
from LexisNexis is truly a next generation business management system, and we are looking forward 
to working with the company.”   
 
Nimbus powered by Microsoft Dynamics AX 2012 from LexisNexis goes beyond traditional practice 
management software currently available to legal service providers.  It drives operational efficiencies 
and enables evolution of competitive business models by integrating and harmonising all aspects of a 
firm’s operations – from client time recording to collections, financial management and human 
resources – to drive operational efficiencies. The solution also supports the evolution of competitive 
business models. 
 
 
About LexisNexis Legal & Professional  
LexisNexis® Legal & Professional (www.lexisnexis.com) is a leading global provider of content and 
technology solutions that enable professionals in legal, corporate, tax, government, academic and 
non-profit organisations to make informed decisions and achieve better business outcomes.  As a 
digital pioneer, the company was the first to bring legal and business information online with its 
Lexis® and Nexis® services. Today, LexisNexis Legal & Professional harnesses leading-edge 
technology and world-class content, to help professionals work in faster, easier and more effective 
ways. Through close collaboration with its customers, the company ensures organisations can 
leverage its solutions to reduce risk, improve productivity, increase profitability and grow their 
business. Part of Reed Elsevier, LexisNexis Legal & Professional serves customers in more than 100 
countries with 10,000 employees worldwide. 
 



As a leading provider of software platforms, LexisNexis® Enterprise Solutions (www.lexisnexis-
es.co.uk) works with customers to drive productive, efficient and reliable business decisions. Its 
solutions include LexisNexis® Visualfiles®, for case and matter management; LexisNexis® dna, for 
fully-integrated practice management; LexisNexis® Redwood Analytics®, for business intelligence and 
budgeting software and services; and LexisNexis® InterAction®, a customer relationship management 
tool. 
 
About Eclipse Computing (Australia) Pty Ltd (www.eclipsecomputing.com.au)   
Established in 1991, Eclipse is a leading provider of intelligent business solutions to the enterprise 
and mid-market. With a team of over 400 people located in Australia (Sydney, Melbourne, Canberra, 
Perth, Brisbane, Adelaide and Hobart), New Zealand (Auckland, Wellington), Fiji (Suva) and North 
America (Vancouver, Calgary, Grand Rapids), Eclipse provides expertise and reliable service to help 
over 1,200 customers meet their business objectives. 
 
Eclipse is part of the publicly listed Australian investment company, UXC Ltd. 
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